
AMENDMENTS TO THE ACCOUNTANTS ACT HERALDS 
A NEW DAWN FOR ACCOUNTANTS IN KENYA

AMENDED SECTION

Under Section 18 (2) of the Accountants Act the requirements for a 
practicing certificate is:

(2) Any person who contravenes subsection (1) commits an offence and is 
liable on conviction to a fine not exceeding one hundred thousand shillings 
or to imprisonment for a period not exceeding three years or both.

Under the Accountants Act, S.21 (7) Where a practicing certificate ceases 
to be in force under subsection (3), the person to whom the certificate was 
issued shall deliver it to the Institute within fourteen days after the date on 
which he ceases to be registered.

S. 21 (8) Any person who, without reasonable excuse, contravenes 
subsection (7) commits an offence and is liable on conviction to a fine not 
exceeding five thousand shillings.

In the Accountants Act S. 24. Application for registration 
(1) A person wishing to be registered as an accountant shall apply to the 
Registration Committee. 
(2) An application to be registered as an accountant shall be in the 
prescribed form and shall be accompanied by the prescribed fee. 
(5) A person who, in an application to be registered, willfully makes a 
false or misleading statement commits an offence and shall be liable on 
conviction to a fine not exceeding fifty thousand shillings or to imprisonment 
for a period not exceeding eighteen months or to both.

41. Offences 
(1) A person who— 
1. (a)  assumes or uses the title or designatory letters referred to in 
section 4(2)(a) and who is not a Fellow of the Institute of Certified Public 
Accountants of Kenya; or 
2. (b)  assumes or uses the title or designatory letters referred to in 
section 4(2)(b) and who is not a member of the Institute of Certified Public 
Accountants of Kenya; 
3. (c)  assumes or uses the title “Honorary Fellow of the Institute of 
Certified Public Accountants of Kenya” and who is not such Honorary 
Fellow; or 
4. (d)  otherwise falsely assumes or uses any title or designatory letters 
prescribed by the Minister, commits an offence. 
(2) A corporate body (whether incorporated in Kenya or elsewhere) which 
falsely uses any of the titles or designatory letters referred to in section 4(2)
(a) or (b) commits an offence. 
(3) Where a firm uses the title or designatory letters referred to in section 
4(2) while each of the partners in the firm are not entitled to use the title or 
designatory letters, each of the partners of the firm commits an offence. 
(4) A person who commits an offence under this section is liable on 
conviction to a fine not exceeding fifty thousand shillings, and, in the case of 
a continuing offence, a further fine not exceeding four thousand shillings for 
each day on which the offence continues. 

4. (1) For the purpose of the conduct of the inquiry the Disciplinary 
Committee has power— 
1. (a)  to administer oaths; 
2. (b)  to summon persons to attend and give evidence; 
3. (c)  to order the production of relevant documents, including court 
judgements; and 
4. (d)  to recover in whole or in part the costs of the inquiry not exceeding 
one hundred thousand shillings from any or all the parties involved in the 
proceedings. 

8. (1) A person served with a summons to appear as a witness at the inquiry 
who, without reasonable excuse fails to attend as required by the summons, 
is guilty of an offence. 
(2) A person appearing as a witness at the inquiry who, without reasonable 
excuse— 
1. (a)  refuses or fails to be sworn; 
2. (b)  refuses or fails to answer a question that he is required to answer by 
the Chairman of the Disciplinary Committee; or 
3. (c)  refuses or fails to produce a document that he was required to 
produce by a summons under this Act, served on him, 
commits an offence. 
(3) A person convicted of an offence under this sub-paragraph is liable on 
conviction to a fine not exceeding twenty thousand shillings. 

AMENDMENT IN THE 
FINANCE ACT

Under S. 78. Section 18 of the Accountants Act, 
2008 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting 
the words “one hundred thousand” and 
substituting therefor the words “five hundred 
thousand”.

Under S. 79. Section 21 of the Accountants Act, 
2008 is amended in subsection (8) by deleting 
the words “five thousand” and substituting 
therefor the words “five hundred thousand

S.80 Section 24 of the Accountants Act, 2008 
is amended in subsection (5) by deleting 
the words “fifty thousand” and substituting 
therefor the words “five hundred thousand”

82. Section 41 of the Accountants Act, 2008 
is amended by deleting subsection (4) and 
substituting therefor the following new 
subsection— 

(4) A person who commits an offence under 
this section is liable on conviction to a fine 
not exceeding two million shillings, and, in the 
case of a continuing offence, a further fine not 
exceeding two thousand shillings for each day 
on which the offence continues 

The Fifth Schedule to the Accountants Act, 
20018 is amended in —
(a) in paragraph (4) by deleting the words “one 
hundred thousand” appearing in subparagraph 
(1)(d) and substituting therefor the words “one 
million”; and

(b) in paragraph (8) by deleting the words 
“twenty thousand” appearing in subparagraph 
(3) and substituting therefor the words “five 
hundred thousand”.

LEGAL IMPLICATION

This amendment has enhanced the 
penalty of practicing without a license 
from one hundred thousand shillings to 
five hundred thousand shillings.

This amendment has enhanced the 
penalty for not returning the practicing 
certificate that ceases to be in force 
within fourteen days from five thousand 
shillings to five hundred thousand 
shillings. This is to deter unlicensed 
practitioners or accountants from acting 
as bonafide accountants.

This amendment has enhanced the 
penalty for a person who willfully makes 
a false or misleading statement on 
application for registration commits an 
offence. The penalty has been enhaced  
from fifty thousand shillings to five 
hundred thousand shillings.

This amendment has enhanced the 
penalty for a person or firm or employer 
that uses wrongly the designation of 
FCPA, CPA and HCPA to a fine not 
exceeding two million shillings, and, 
in the case of a continuing offence, a 
further fine not exceeding two thousand 
shillings for each day on which the 
offence continues.

This amendment has enhanced the 
penalty for disciplinary on a person 
or firm to recover in whole or in part 
the costs of the inquiry not exceeding 
one million from any or all the parties 
involved in the proceedings.

This amendment has enhanced fines 
from twenty thousand shillings to five 
hundred thousand shillings for a person 
who refuses to be sworn, fails to answer 
questions, fails to produce documents or 
is held liable for a disciplinary liability 
under this sub-paragraph. 

Conclusion
The leadership of the Institute is confident that these amendments present a new dawn not only to the accountancy profession but also to 

the general public. It is expected that these amendments will go a long way to enhancing accountability and corporate governance across all 
sectors of the economy. Kenyans can now expect a more responsive, professional and expansive accountancy services from our members. 

CPA Edwin Makori, Chief Executive Officer, Institute of Certified Public Accountants of Kenya
The Institute of Certified Public Accountants of Kenya (ICPAK) is the statutory body of Accountants established in 1978 and draws its mandate 

from the Accountants Act No.15 of 2008. It is also a member of the Pan African Federation of Accountants (PAFA) and the International 
Federation of Accountants (IFAC), the global Accountancy umbrella body.

T
he Finance Act 2018 introduced significant amendments 
to the Accountants Act No 15 of 2008.  These are aimed at 
strengthening the profession as well as help the government 
in the fight against graft. Proper regulation of the profession is 
essential for enhanced accountability and governance. Among 

the amendments which are now in force are:

Definition of Accountant
To start with, the Finance Act amended the definition of an Accountant 
which was previously ambiguous and constrained the application 
of the Act. To cure this mischief, the new definition provides that 
“accountant” is a person registered as an accountant under Section 
24 of the Accountant Act and is a member as defined in section 4 
(2) (a) and (b) with expertise achieved through formal education and 
practical experience and shall be held to a high professional standard.

The Act now clearly distinguishes who an accountant is by classifying 
them into the following categories: Trainee Accountants, Associate 
Accountants and a Certified Public Accountant (CPA). The Institute 
will define the role and advise the scope of each category for ease of 
engagement with the users of accountancy services. 

Definition of Accountancy
Accountancy is now defined to include practice in accounting, 
financial reporting, control systems, systems auditing, auditing, 
assurance, forensic accounting and auditing, finance, financial 
management, public finance management, taxation, financial risk 
management, management accounting and advisory services related 
thereto. This revised definition recognizes the growth in Accountancy 
over the years and extends the regulation of the profession to 
emerging areas.

Trainee Accountants
Students intending to pursue Accountancy examinations administered 
by KASNEB will be required to register with the Institute prior to 
sitting the examinations. The Examinations Board will now, prior to 
registering a person to undertake any Accountancy examinations, 
require that the person be registered as a member of the Institute of 
Certified Public Accountants of Kenya (ICPAK). 

The amended Act defines a trainee accountant as a person registered 
by the Examinations Board and who has commenced professional 
accountancy education or training or is practicing accountancy as 
part of initial professional development required for qualification as an 
accountant. The trainee accountant will also be subjected to practical 
training by the Institute before completing their examinations. The 
new requirement is in tandem with the International Accounting 
Education Standards Board (IAESB) standards. The standards 
prescribe the pre-qualification and post-qualification requirements 
for aspiring and qualified accountants. 

In addition, all individuals practicing accountants but who have 
not registered with the Institute or are working while pursuing 
their accountancy qualification will be required to register with the 
Institute as Trainee Accountants. The Trainee Accountant will not pay 

any fees or subscriptions to the Institute. The Institute will be issuing a 
membership card for all Trainee Accountants for use in the market and 
shall not designate themselves as professional accountants. 

Moreover, for those who have passed their final CPA examinations but do 
not meet the criteria for admission as Certified Public Accountant (CPA), 
they will be registered under associate member category. They shall not 
hold themselves as professional accountants.

The public and employers are cautioned against the use of the designation 
accountant. In the recent past, there has been abuse of the professional 
qualification by having persons with examination qualification of part  I, II 
or III purportedly referring themselves as “CPA I, II or III”. There is no such 
designation in the profession. The employers should cease and desist 
from using such designations which are not anchored in law. Employers 
will be required to pay hefty fines of upto two million shillings and a 
further fine of two thousand shillings for every day the offence continues.

Prescription of the Remuneration Order
The amended Act now empowers the Treasury Cabinet Secretary on the 
advice of ICPAK Council, to prescribe a remuneration order. The Law 
provides that the Council shall, “prescribe the remuneration order for 
the accountancy profession with the approval of the Cabinet Secretary 
responsible for finance.” The Institute is confident that this provision will 
not only provide consistency and predictability among the practicing 
professionals but will insulate users of accountancy services from 
vagaries of unregulated fee regime. This will enhance uniformity of 
services rendered by accountants. The law now provides a framework 
for prescribing minimum rates based on speciality, scope of work and 
capacity to undertake the work rather than on the pricing.

Professional conduct, protection in practice and enhanced 
integrity 
Accountants have been on the receiving end in the wake of never-ending 
graft related cases. They have been accused of being complacent and 
passive participants in these heinous economic crimes. To address 
this problem, the amendment provides a new section that protects 
Accountants from vindictive employers and clients in case they detect 
issues and inform authorities on such malpractices.

Section 30 introduces several sub sections that give effect to this 
requirement. Subsection (2)— (2A) requires and obligates an accountant 
to observe the ethical guidelines and applicable standards in the 
discharge of duty. Subsection (2B) states that the ethical guidelines and 
applicable standards of the accountancy profession shall take precedence 
over any instructions from a client or other person. While subsection (2C) 
insulates an accountant from any form of harassment, civil suit or being 
subjected to a disciplinary action for taking such actions or decisions or 
rejecting instructions from a client if such action, decision or rejection is 
in pursuance of the provisions of subsections (2A) and (2B). 

Fines and remedies
The amendments have enhanced fines to a new threshold. The 
Amendments enhance these fines up to a maximum of Kshs 2 million 
depending on the severity of professional misconduct.


